

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies:
 FOR: Air Fresheners & Odor Control
 TIME & (June 1, 2018 through May 31, 2019)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., June 8, 2018

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Pyramid School Products 6510 N 54th St. Tampa, FL 33610-1908	Safeway Supply, Inc. 10841 Hillpoint Drive San Antonio, TX 78217	Gulf Coast Paper Co. 8655 NE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78219-4304	Olmsted Kirk Equipment and Supply	Meister Supply
AIR FRESHNERS/ODOR CONTROL							
BASE YEAR: June 1, 2018 through May 31, 2019							
1.	METERED AIR FRESHNER, (9213) Size: 5.3 OZ, (12 per Case) Scent: Ocean Breeze Brand: Technical Concepts Product Code: TC 401547 Manufacturer: Rubbermaid Estimated Qty = 50 cases/yr (HOSPECO HS-07908 Approved Substitute) (Time Mist TMS 4725 Approved Substitute)	Price per Case Total Size Scent Brand Product Code Manufacturer Qty per Case	26.59 1,329.50 12-7 oz cans/cs Tropical Tradewinds Hospesco 07908 Hospesco 12	25.00 1,250.00 Ocean Mist Weise NAEDC02 Weise 12	30.66 1,533.00 5.3 oz Tropical Breeze Hospesco 7908.00 Hospesco 12		
2.	METERED AIR FRESHNER, (9212) Size: 5.3 OZ Can, (12 per Case) Scent: Cinnamon Spice Brand: Technical Concepts Product Code: TC 400696 Manufacturer: Rubbermaid Estimated Qty = 50 Cases/year (HOSPECO HS-07901 Approved Substitute) (Time Mist TMS 2521 Approved Substitute)	Price per Case Total Size Scent Brand Product Code Manufacturer Qty per Case	26.59 1,329.50 12-7 oz cans/cs Cinnamon Spice Hospesco 07906 Hospesco 12	25.00 1,250.00 Cinnamon Weise Weise 12	30.66 1,533.00 5.3 oz Cinnamon Trade Words 7906.00 Hospesco 12		
3.	URINAL SCREEN W/DEODORIZER BLOCK (17030) Scent: Green Apple or Cherry Estimated Qty: 42 Boxes per year Manufacturer: Krystal or Advantage	Price per Box Total Scent Qty per box Manufacturer	11.98 503.16 Cherry 12/box Krystal #165-4	11.00 462.00 Cherry 12 Safeway	14.59 612.78 Green Apple 12		
4.	MAT, URINAL FLOOR DISPOSABLE (17647) Size: 17-1/2" x 20 (7 per case) Brand: Uriguard Part No: 8600 Manufacturer: Spartan Estimated Qty: 7 Cases per year (Impact 1525 Approved Substitute)	Price per Case Total Size Brand Part No. Manufacturer Qty per case	29.94 209.58 17.5" x 20" Hospesco AS-ACOM-P Hospesco 6	36.90 258.30 Impact 1525 Impact 6	34.66 242.62 As Specified Taski Hospesco 6		
5.	DEODRANT BLOCK TOILET BOWL (11371) WITH PLASTIC HANGER 4 OZ Size: 12 per case Brand: HOSPECO Chery Part No. HA 08411 (One Dozen) Manufacturer: Spartan Est. Qty = 10 dozen per year	Price per Dozen Total Size Brand Part No. Manufacturer	7.98 79.80 4 oz Hospesco 08411 Hospesco	7.25 72.50 4 oz Safeway 203887 Safeway	10.2 102.00 As Specified Cherry 8411		
6.	SPRAY DISINFECTANT (11440) Size: 19 oz (12 per case) Scent: Original Brand: Professional Lysol Product Code: REC 04650 Manufacturer: Reckitt Benckiser Estimated Qty.: 100 Cases per year	Price per Case Total Size Scent Brand Product Code Manufacturer Qty per case	71.68 7,168.00 12-19 oz per case Original Lysol 04650 Reckitt Benckiser 12-19 oz cans/cs	73.00 7,300.00 19 oz Original Professional Lysol REC04650 Reckitt Benckiser 12	76.30 7,630.00 As Specified Original Lysol 4650 Reckitt 12		
						NO BID	NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies:
 FOR: Air Fresheners & Odor Control
 TIME & (June 1, 2018 through May 31, 2019)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., June 8, 2018
 ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

		Pyramid School Products 6510 N 54th St. Tampa, FL 33610-1908	Safeway Supply, Inc. 10841 Hillpoint Drive San Antonio, TX 78217	Gulf Coast Paper Co. 8655 NE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78219-4304	Olmsted Kirk Equipment and Supply	Meister Supply
7.	SPRAY DISINFECTANT (33256) Size: 19 oz (12 per case) Brand: Clorox Fresh Scent Product code: CLO-38504 Manufacturer: Procter & Gamble Estimated Qty: 20 cases per year	Price per pack Total Size Brand Product Code Manufacturer Qty per pack	48.89 977.80 12-19 oz cans/cs Clorox CLO 38504 Clorox 12	48.00 960.00 Claire C-015 Claire 12	52.50 1,050.00 As Specified Disf Spray 38504 Clorox 12	
8.	T CELL DISPENSER WHITE (32374) Product Code: TC402092 Manufacturer: Technical Concepts Est. Qty = 50 per year	Price Each Total Product Code Manufacturer Qty per case Brand Size	3.92 196.00 1793547 Rubbermaid 12 	3.00 150.00 204050 Arriba 12 	3.99 199.50 1793547 RM 12 	
9.	T CELL CITRUS REFILL CARTRIDGE (32375) Product Code: TC402113 Size: 6 to a case Manufacturer: Technical Concepts Estimated Qty: 50 cases per year	Price Per Case Total Product Code Manufacturer Qty per case	43.74 2,187.00 402113 Rubbermaid 6	62.00 3,100.00 204059 Arriba 6	45.00 2,250.00 402113 RM 6	
10.	AEROSOL DISPENSER (33257) Product Code: TC401442 Manufacturer: Technical Concepts or Hospeco 07521 Estimated Quantity: 12 per year	Price Each Total Product Code Manufacturer	20.99 251.88 07521 Hospeco	10.00 120.00 201172 Weise	21.80 261.60 7521 Hospeco	
			*			
	BASE YEAR GRAND TOTAL ITEMS 1-10	Total	14,232.22	14,922.80	15,414.50	
	AIR FRESHNERS/ODOR CONTROL					
	OPTION YEAR ONE: June 1, 2019 through May 31, 2020					
1.	METERED AIR FRESHNER, (9213) Size: 5.3 OZ, (12 per Case) Scent: Ocean Breeze Brand: Technical Concepts Product Code: TC 401547 Manufacturer: Rubbermaid Estimated Qty = 50 cases/yr (HOSPECO HS-07908 Approved Substitute) (Time Mist TMS 4725 Approved Substitute)	Price per Case Total Size Scent Brand Product Code Manufacturer Qty per Case	27.92 1,396.00 12-7 oz cans/cs Tropical Tradewinds Hospeco 07908 Hospeco 12	26.50 1,325.00 Ocean Mist Weise NAEDC02 Weise 12	33.00 1,650.00 As Specified Tropical Breeze Hospeco 7908 Hospeco 12	
2.	METERED AIR FRESHNER, (9212) Size: 5.3 OZ Can, (12 per Case) Scent: Cinnamon Spice Brand: Technical Concepts Product Code: TC 400696 Manufacturer: Rubbermaid Estimated Qty = 50 Cases/year (HOSPECO HS-07901 Approved Substitute) (Time Mist TMS 2521 Approved Substitute)	Price per Case Total Size Scent Brand Product Code Manufacturer Qty per Case	27.92 1,396.00 12-7 oz cans/cs Cinnamon Spice Hospeco 07906 Hospeco 12	26.50 1,325.00 Cinnamon Weise Weise 12	33.00 1,650.00 As Specified Cinnamon Trade Words 7901 Hospeco 12	

NO BID

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies:
 FOR: Air Fresheners & Odor Control
 TIME & (June 1, 2018 through May 31, 2019)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., June 8, 2018

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Pyramid School Products 6510 N 54th St. Tampa, FL 33610-1908	Safeway Supply, Inc. 10841 Hillpoint Drive San Antonio, TX 78217	Gulf Coast Paper Co. 8655 NE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78219-4304	Olmsted Kirk Equipment and Supply	Meister Supply
3.	URINAL SCREEN W/DEODORIZER BLOCK (17030) Scent: Green Apple or Cherry Estimated Qty: 42 Boxes per year Manufacturer: Krystal or Advantage	Price per Box Total Scent Qty per box Manufacturer	12.60 529.20 Cherry 12/box Krystal #165-4	12.00 504.00 Cherry 12 Safeway	16.00 672.00 Green Apple 12 Boardwalk		
4.	MAT, URINAL FLOOR DISPOSABLE (17647) Size: 17-1/2" x 20 (7 per case) Brand: Uriguard Part No: 8600 Manufacturer: Spartan Estimated Qty: 7 Cases per year (Impact 1525 Approved Substitute)	Price per Case Total Size Brand Part No. Manufacturer Qty per case	31.45 220.15 17.5" x 20" Hospeco AS-ACOM-P Hospeco 6	38.50 269.50 Impact 1525 Impact 6	36.00 252.00 As Specified Taski As Specified Hospeco 6		
5.	DEODRANT BLOCK TOILET BOWL (11371) WITH PLASTIC HANGER 4 OZ Size: 12 per case Brand: HOSPECO Chery Part No. HA 08411 (One Dozen) Manufacturer: Spartan Est. Qty = 10 dozen per year	Price per Dozen Total Size Brand Part No. Manufacturer	8.38 83.80 4 oz Hospeco 08411 Hospeco	7.60 76.00 4 oz Safeway 203887 Safeway	11.00 110.00 As Specified Cherry 8411 Hospeco		
6.	SPRAY DISINFECTANT (11440) Size: 19 oz (12 per case) Scent: Original Brand: Professional Lysol Product Code: REC 04650 Manufacturer: Reckitt Benckiser Estimated Qty.: 100 Cases per year	Price per Case Total Size Scent Brand Product Code Manufacturer Qty per case	75.29 7,529.00 12-19 oz per case Original Lysol 04650 Reckitt Benckiser 12-19 oz cans/cs	74.00 7,400.00 19 oz Original Professional Lysol REC04650 Reckitt Benckiser 12	80.00 8,000.00 As Specified As Specified As Specified 4650 Reckitt 12	NO BID	NO BID
7.	SPRAY DISINFECTANT (33256) Size: 19 oz (12 per case) Brand: Clorox Fresh Scent Product code: CLO-38504 Manufacturer: Procter & Gamble Estimated Qty: 20 cases per year	Price per pack Total Size Brand Product Code Manufacturer Qty per pack	51.33 1,026.60 12-19 oz cans/cs Clorox CLO 38504 Clorox 12	48.80 976.00 Claire C-015 Claire 12	54.00 1,080.00 As Specified Fresh Scent 38504 Clorox 12		
8.	T CELL DISPENSER WHITE (32374) Product Code: TC402092 Manufacturer: Technical Concepts Est. Qty = 50 per year	Price Each Total Product Code Manufacturer Qty per case Brand Size	4.12 206.00 1793547 Rubbermaid 12 Rubbermaid	3.00 150.00 204050 Arriba 12 Arriba	5.00 250.00 As Specified RM 12 RM		
9.	T CELL CITRUS REFILL CARTRIDGE (32375) Product Code: TC402113 Size: 6 to a case Manufacturer: Technical Concepts Estimated Qty: 50 cases per year	Price Per Case Total Product Code Manufacturer Qty per case	45.93 2,296.50 402113 Rubbermaid 6	62.00 3,100.00 204059 Arriba 6	48.00 2,400.00 402113 RM 6		

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies:
 FOR: Air Fresheners & Odor Control
 TIME & (June 1, 2018 through May 31, 2019)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., June 8, 2018

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Pyramid School Products 6510 N 54th St. Tampa, FL 33610-1908	Safeway Supply, Inc. 10841 Hillpoint Drive San Antonio, TX 78217	Gulf Coast Paper Co. 8655 NE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78219-4304	Olmsted Kirk Equipment and Supply	Meister Supply
10.	AEROSOL DISPENSER (33257) Product Code: TC401442 Manufacturer: Technical Concepts or Hospeco 07521 Estimated Quantity: 12 per year	Price Each Total Product Code Manufacturer	22.05 264.60 07521 Hospeco	12.00 144.00 201172 Weise	22.00 264.00 7521 Hospeco		
	OPTION YEAR ONE GRAND TOTAL ITEMS 1-10	Total	14,947.85	15,269.50	16,328.00		
	AIR FRESHNERS/ODOR CONTROL						
	OPTION YEAR TWO: June 1, 2020 through May 31, 2021						
1.	METERED AIR FRESHNER, (9213) Size: 5.3 OZ, (12 per Case) Scent: Ocean Breeze Brand: Technical Concepts Product Code: TC 401547 Manufacturer: Rubbermaid Estimated Qty = 50 cases/yr (HOSPECO HS-07908 Approved Substitute) (Time Mist TMS 4725 Approved Substitute)	Price per Case Total Size Scent Brand Product Code Manufacturer Qty per Case	29.32 1,466.00 12-7 oz cans/cs Tropical Tradewinds Hospeco 07908 Hospeco 12	27.00 1,350.00 Ocean Mist Weise NAEDC02 Weise 12	34.00 1,700.00 As Specified As Specified As Specified 7908.00 Hospeco 12		
2.	METERED AIR FRESHNER, (9212) Size: 5.3 OZ Can, (12 per Case) Scent: Cinnamon Spice Brand: Technical Concepts Product Code: TC 400696 Manufacturer: Rubbermaid Estimated Qty = 50 Cases/year (HOSPECO HS-07901 Approved Substitute) (Time Mist TMS 2521 Approved Substitute)	Price per Case Total Size Scent Brand Product Code Manufacturer Qty per Case	29.32 1,466.00 12-7 oz cans/cs Cinnamon Spice Hospeco 07906 Hospeco 12	27.00 1,350.00 Cinnamon Weise Weise 12	34.00 1,700.00 As Specified Cinnamon Hospeco 7901.00 Hospeco 12	NO BID	NO BID
3.	URINAL SCREEN W/DEODORIZER BLOCK (17030) Scent: Green Apple or Cherry Estimated Qty: 42 Boxes per year Manufacturer: Krystal or Advantage	Price per Box Total Scent Qty per box Manufacturer	13.23 555.66 Cherry 12/box Krystal #165-4	12.60 529.20 Cherry 12 Safeway	17.00 714.00 As Specified 12 Hospeco		
4.	MAT, URINAL FLOOR DISPOSABLE (17647) Size: 17-1/2" x 20 (7 per case) Brand: Uriguard Part No: 8600 Manufacturer: Spartan Estimated Qty: 7 Cases per year (Impact 1525 Approved Substitute)	Price per Case Total Size Brand Part No. Manufacturer Qty per case	33.03 231.21 17.5" x 20" Hospeco AS-ACOM-P Hospeco 6	40.50 283.50 Impact 1525 Impact 6	37.00 259.00 As Specified As Specified Hospeco 6		
5.	DEODRANT BLOCK TOILET BOWL (11371) WITH PLASTIC HANGER 4 OZ Size: 12 per case Brand: HOSPECO Chery Part No. HA 08411 (One Dozen) Manufacturer: Spartan Est. Qty = 10 dozen per year	Price per Dozen Total Size Brand Part No. Manufacturer	8.80 88.00 4 oz Hospeco 08411 Hospeco	8.00 80.00 4 oz Safeway 203887 Safeway	11.00 110.00 As Specified Hospeco 08411 Hospeco		

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies:
FOR: Air Fresheners & Odor Control
TIME & (June 1, 2018 through May 31, 2019)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., June 8, 2018
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

		Pyramid School Products 6510 N 54th St. Tampa, FL 33610-1908	Safeway Supply, Inc. 10841 Hillpoint Drive San Antonio, TX 78217	Gulf Coast Paper Co. 8655 NE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78219-4304	Olmsted Kirk Equipment and Supply	Meister Supply	
6.	SPRAY DISINFECTANT (11440) Size: 19 oz (12 per case) Scent: Original Brand: Professional Lysol Product Code: REC 04650 Manufacturer: Reckitt Benckiser Estimated Qty.: 100 Cases per year	Price per Case 79.05 Total 7,905.00 Size 12-19 oz per case Scent Original Brand Lysol Product Code 04650 Manufacturer Reckitt Benckiser Qty per case 12-19 oz cans/cs	76.50 7,650.00 19 oz Original Professional Lysol REC04650 Reckitt Benckiser 12	86.00 8,600.00 As Specified As Specified Lysol 04650 Reckitt 12	NO BID	NO BID	
7.	SPRAY DISINFECTANT (33256) Size: 19 oz (12 per case) Brand: Clorox Fresh Scent Product code: CLO-38504 Manufacturer: Procter & Gamble Estimated Qty: 20 cases per year	Price per pack 53.90 Total 1,078.00 Size 12-19 oz cans/cs Brand Clorox Product Code CLO 38504 Manufacturer Clorox Qty per pack 12	50.20 1,004.00 As Specified Claire C-015 Claire 12	56.00 1,120.00 As Specified Clorox 38504 Clorox 12			
8.	T CELL DISPENSER WHITE (32374) Product Code: TC402092 Manufacturer: Technical Concepts Est. Qty = 50 per year	Price Each 4.33 Total 216.50 Product Code 1793547 Manufacturer Rubbermaid Qty per case 12 Brand Size	4.00 200.00 204050 Arriba 6	6.00 300.00 1793547 RM 12			
9.	T CELL CITRUS REFILL CARTRIDGE (32375) Product Code: TC402113 Size: 6 to a case Manufacturer: Technical Concepts Estimated Qty: 50 cases per year	Price Per Case 48.22 Total 2,411.00 Product Code 402113 Manufacturer Rubbermaid Qty per case 6	64.00 3,200.00 204059 Arriba 6	50.00 2,500.00 402113 RM 6			
10.	AEROSOL DISPENSER (33257) Product Code: TC401442 Manufacturer: Technical Concepts or Hospeco 07521 Estimated Quantity: 12 per year	Price Each 23.15 Total 277.80 Product Code 07521 Manufacturer Hospeco	10.00 120.00 201172 Weise	23.00 276.00 7521 Hospeco			
OPTION YEAR TWO GRAND TOTAL ITEMS 1-10		Total	15,695.17	15,766.70			17,279.00
OPTION YEAR THREE: June 1, 2021 through May 31, 2022							
1.	METERED AIR FRESHNER, (9213) Size: 5.3 OZ, (12 per Case) Scent: Ocean Breeze Brand: Technical Concepts Product Code: TC 401547 Manufacturer: Rubbermaid Estimated Qty = 50 cases/yr (HOSPECO HS-07908 Approved Substitute) (Time Mist TMS 4725 Approved Substitute)	Price per Case 30.79 Total 1,539.50 Size 12-7 oz cans/cs Scent Tropical Tradewinds Brand Hospeco Product Code 07908 Manufacturer Hospeco Qty per Case 12	29.00 1,450.00 Ocean Mist Weise NAEDC02 Weise 12	35.00 1,750.00 As Specified Tropical Breeze Hospeco 7908 Weise 12			

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies:
FOR: Air Fresheners & Odor Control
TIME & (June 1, 2018 through May 31, 2019)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., June 8, 2018
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Pyramid School Products 6510 N 54th St. Tampa, FL 33610-1908	Safeway Supply, Inc. 10841 Hillpoint Drive San Antonio, TX 78217	Gulf Coast Paper Co. 8655 NE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78219-4304	Olmsted Kirk Equipment and Supply	Meister Supply
2.	METERED AIR FRESHNER, (9212) Size: 5.3 OZ Can, (12 per Case) Scent: Cinnamon Spice Brand: Technical Concepts Product Code: TC 400696 Manufacturer: Rubbermaid Estimated Qty = 50 Cases/year (HOSPECO HS-07901 Approved Substitute) (Time Mist TMS 2521 Approved Substitute)	Price per Case Total Size Scent Brand Product Code Manufacturer Qty per Case	30.79 1,539.50 12-7 oz cans/cs Cinnamon Spice Hospesco 07906 Hospesco 12	29.00 1,450.00 Cinnamon Weise Weise 12	35.00 1,750.00 As Specified Cinnamon Trade Words 07901 Hospesco 12	NO BID	NO BID
3.	URINAL SCREEN W/DEODORIZER BLOCK (17030) Scent: Green Apple or Cherry Estimated Qty: 42 Boxes per year Manufacturer: Krystal or Advantage	Price per Box Total Scent Qty per box Manufacturer	13.89 583.38 Cherry 12/box Krystal #165-4	13.10 550.20 Cherry 12 Safeway	17.00 714.00 Apple 12 Boardwalk		
4.	MAT, URINAL FLOOR DISPOSABLE (17647) Size: 17-1/2" x 20 (7 per case) Brand: Uriguard Part No: 8600 Manufacturer: Spartan Estimated Qty: 7 Cases per year (Impact 1525 Approved Substitute)	Price per Case Total Size Brand Part No. Manufacturer Qty per case	34.69 242.83 17.5" x 20" Hospesco AS-ACOM-P Hospesco 6	39.80 278.60 Impact 1525 Impact 6	38.00 266.00 As Specified Taski Hospesco 6		
5.	DEODRANT BLOCK TOILET BOWL (11371) WITH PLASTIC HANGER 4 OZ Size: 12 per case Brand: HOSPECO Chery Part No. HA 08411 (One Dozen) Manufacturer: Spartan Est. Qty = 10 dozen per year	Price per Dozen Total Size Brand Part No. Manufacturer	9.24 92.40 4 oz Hospesco 08411 Hospesco	8.40 84.00 4 oz Safeway 203887 Safeway	12.00 120.00 As Specified Hospesco 08411 Hospesco		
6.	SPRAY DISINFECTANT (11440) Size: 19 oz (12 per case) Scent: Original Brand: Professional Lysol Product Code: REC 04650 Manufacturer: Reckitt Benckiser Estimated Qty.: 100 Cases per year	Price per Case Total Size Scent Brand Product Code Manufacturer Qty per case	83.00 8,300.00 12-19 oz per case Original Lysol 04650 Reckitt Benckiser 12-19 oz cans/cs	77.00 7,700.00 19 oz Original Professional Lysol REC04650 Reckitt Benckiser 12	90.00 9,000.00 As Specified As Specified As Specified 04650 Reckitt 12		
7.	SPRAY DISINFECTANT (33256) Size: 19 oz (12 per case) Brand: Clorox Fresh Scent Product code: CLO-38504 Manufacturer: Procter & Gamble Estimated Qty: 20 cases per year	Price per pack Total Size Brand Product Code Manufacturer Qty per pack	56.60 1,132.00 12-19 oz cans/cs Clorox CLO 38504 Clorox 12	49.90 998.00 Claire C-015 Claire 12	60.00 1,200.00 As Specified Clorox 38504 Clorox 12		
8.	T CELL DISPENSER WHITE (32374) Product Code: TC402092 Manufacturer: Technical Concepts Est. Qty = 50 per year	Price Each Total Product Code Manufacturer Qty per case Brand Size	4.55 227.50 1793547 Rubbermaid 12 12	4.00 200.00 204050 Arriba 12 12	8.00 400.00 1793547 RM 12 12		

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies:
FOR: Air Fresheners & Odor Control
TIME & (June 1, 2018 through May 31, 2019)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., June 8, 2018

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Pyramid School Products 6510 N 54th St. Tampa, FL 33610-1908	Safeway Supply, Inc. 10841 Hillpoint Drive San Antonio, TX 78217	Gulf Coast Paper Co. 8655 NE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78219-4304	Olmsted Kirk Equipment and Supply	Meister Supply
9.	T CELL CITRUS REFILL CARTRIDGE (32375) Product Code: TC402113 Size: 6 to a case Manufacturer: Technical Concepts Estimated Qty: 50 cases per year	Price Per Case Total Product Code Manufacturer Qty per case	50.63 2,531.50 402113 Rubbermaid 6	65.60 3,280.00 204059 Arriba 6	52.00 2,600.00 402113 RM 6	NO BID	NO BID
10.	AEROSOL DISPENSER (33257) Product Code: TC401442 Manufacturer: Technical Concepts or Hospeco 07521 Estimated Quantity: 12 per year	Price Each Total Product Code Manufacturer	24.31 291.72 07521 Hospeco	12.00 144.00 201172 Weise	25.00 300.00 07521 Hospeco		
OPTION YEAR THREE GRAND TOTAL ITEMS 1-10		Total	16,480.33	16,134.80	18,100.00		
GRAND TOTAL BASE YEAR, EXT 1, EXT 2 & EXT 3			61,355.57	62,093.80	67,121.50		
	Terms		Net 30 days	Net 30 days	1% 30 days		
	Delivery Days		7-10 days	1-3 days	3 days		

***LOW BIDDER**

BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Arrow Magnolia
Austin Vacuum SA
CCS, Inc.
Cleaning Ideas
DC Distributing
Gulf Coast Paper Co.
Matera Paper Co.

Perfect Scents
Pollock Paper Dist.
Pyramid School Products
Safeway Supply, Inc.
State Industrial
Torrez Paper
Z and V International LLC

Demandstar
SAWS Website